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About this property
 

We present to you two storied house with a large
courtyard and garden, located in a very nice and
quiet area. The property is disposed in Xaisettha
district in Vientiane capital. The house is unfinished
and needs renovation and refreshment such as
plastering, painting, tiling and wooden working. Its
total living area is 360 sq. m, and distributes as it
follows – ground floor-kitchen, dining area, living
area, bedrooms and bathroom. Second floor -
hallway with cement flooring, bed rooms, bathrooms
and balcony. An inner stairs leads to the floors.
Electricity and water supply are available in the
house. There is a good road to the house, which is
accessible in the rainy and dry season. The
courtyard is overgrown with brush and grasses. The
village is nice and well developed. There you can
find all basic amenities as market, hotel, bank,
school and restaurant. All other facilities can be
found in the near district.
Property reservation
If you are interesting in this house and decide to
purchase it,we will start the preparation of the
necessary documents for completion of the deal.
Please contact the responsible estate agent for more
information about the purchase procedure and the
payment methods.
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