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About this property
 

House for rent in  Xaisettha district, Vientiane
capital.
This attractive house (living area is 240 sq.m) with
excellent location, situated in Xaisettha district,
Vientiane capital. This house consists of:  3
bedrooms with a large window which are able to
overlook the gardens; 4 bathrooms with modern
shower, toilets and a luxury reproduction; spacious
veranda, a leisured class living area, kitchen and
dining areas. It is designed beautifully. Furthermore,
everything you need for a super comfortable stay is
provided in this house. All rooms are furnished which
provides air conditioning, electric hot water, water
supply, TV - sat, DSL - internet, refrigerator and
furnishings. Furthermore, the small yard is planted
with decorative trees. In addition you will meet with
a friendly neighborhood. Further recreational and
entertainment are already in place.
RENTING PRICE:
The renting price for a long term and short term can
be negotiated; it does not include consumption
expenses for electricity, water, cable TV, internet,
garden maintenance.
 

 
 

To book a premium property
advertising product contact
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